IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLINOIS EASTERN DIVISION

DOROTHY GAUTREAUX, et al.,	
Plaintiffs,	
vs.	No. 66 C 1459
CHICAGO HOUSING AUTHORITY,	
Defendant.	

AFFIDAVIT OF MARY E. ANDERSON SUPPORTING MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES AGAINST CHA

- I, Mary E. Anderson, being duly sworn, say:
- 1. I was one of the attorneys for plaintiffs in <u>Gautreaux v. Chicago Housing</u>

 <u>Authority</u>, Civil Action No. 66 C 1459, in the United States District Court for the Northern District of Illinois.
- 2. I am a graduate of Swarthmore College (B.A., 1992, Major in Political Science, Minors in Economics and Religion, with High Honors) where I received the Harry S. Truman Scholarship for public service. I am also a graduate of Princeton University's Woodrow Wilson of International and Public Affairs (M.P.A., 1997, Concentration in Domestic Policy with a Certificate in Urban and Regional Planning), and a graduate of New York University School of Law (J.D., 1998, cum laude) where I received the Root, Tilden, Snow Scholarship and was an Associate Editor of the Review of Law and Social Change.
- 3. I am admitted to practice in the State courts of Illinois and New York, and in the federal courts of the Northern District of Illinois.

- 3. From February, 2002 until February, 2003, I was a Staff Attorney and a salaried employee of Business and Professional People for the Public Interest (BPI). BPI was incorporated as an Illinois not-for-profit corporation in 1969 and since that time has functioned as a public interest law and policy center.
- 4. During my time at BPI, I had primary and secondary responsibilities on a variety of legal and policy matters concentrating on housing. As well as being one of the several counsel on the <u>Gautreaux</u> litigation, I provided legal and policy research and analysis on affordable housing issues for the Regional Affordable Housing Initiative.
- 5. Previous to BPI, from September, 2000 until February, 2002, I was a Staff Attorney and Skadden Fellow at the Law Project of the Chicago Coalition for the Homeless (CCH). At CCH, I had primary and secondary responsibilities for litigation and hearings pertaining to the educational rights of homeless children in Chicago and the surrounding suburbs.
- 6. From August, 1998 until September, 2000, I was a judicial law clerk for the Honorable David H. Coar of the Northern District of Illinois. As Judge Coar's clerk, my primary responsibility was to research and draft opinions and memos for Judge Coar pertaining to cases presently before him.
- 7. Currently, I am Senior Counsel to Governor Rod Blagojevich of the State of Illinois. I have served as his Senior Counsel since February, 2003. As Senior Counsel, I am one of the Governor's primary legal advisors and I address the majority of legal matters that come before the Governor.
- 8. I worked on the <u>Gautreaux</u> litigation during my entire tenure at BPI. Under the general supervision of Alex Polikoff and Julie Brown, I had responsibilities relating to the Working Groups for the Lakefront, Madden/Wells and Drexel redevelopments. This work

included drafting motions and negotiating legal issues pertaining to these redevelopments. I also worked on issues relating to relocation of public housing residents during the implementation of the CHA Transformation Plan. This work is reflected in the attached Exhibit A.

- 9. BPI has an understanding with its salaried attorneys (including me) that any attorneys' fees awarded for their services will be paid to the organization and not to the individual attorneys. Any fees awarded for my services in this case will be paid to BPI.
- 10. Throughout the time I have participated in this case will be paid to BPI. I recorded the hours spent in contemporaneous daily time records. In October of 2003, I prepared a written record (set forth in Exhibit A hereto) of the professional time that I have spent from June 26, 2002 up to February 7, 2003 on this case. This written record is based upon time records that I maintained for that period. I did not record, nor did I set forth in Exhibit A, numerous instances in which I spent less than 15 minutes on tasks (such as telephone calls and brief discussions) related to this case. The number of hours of professional time which I have spent on this case thus substantially exceeds the number of hours set forth in Exhibit A.

Further affiant sayeth not.

Mary G. Clude Mary E. Anderson

Subscribed and Sworn to

before me this 5th day

of December, 2003

Notary Public

"OFFICIAL SEAL"
PAULA KRUGER
otary Public, State of Illinois

My Commission Expires Feb. 16, 2004

DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
06/06/02	2.00	Draft Madden/Wells Revitalization Area Motion and Affidavit
06/12/02	2.00	Draft Madden/Wells Revitalization Area Motion and Affidavit
06/12/02	1.25	GTX team mtg
06/14/02	1.00	Draft Madden/Wells Revitalization motion and affidavit
06/17/02	3.00	Madden/Wells Working Group meeting
06/19/02	0.50	Phone call with RLJ re Madden/Wells working group
06/19/02	1.00	Mtg w JEB, AEG, ALP re prep for Mobility mtg w CHA
06/20/02	2.50	Lakefront working group background and file review
06/20/02	3.00	Lakefront Working Group mtg
06/24/02	3.25	Madden/Wells Working Grp and Community Mtg
06/26/02	1.75	GTX team mtg
06/27/02	1.00	Follow-up research on Revitalization motion
07/01/02	1.00	TC w/CHA (Lillian Fuentes) re comments on Revitalization motion
07/02/02	0.50	OC w/ALP re Revitalization motion
07/02/02	1.00	Draft response to Madden/Wells resident letter
07/03/02	2.00	Draft and edit Lakefront Revitalization motion and background work
07/08/02	1.75	Madden/Wells community mtg
07/10/02	1.00	Phone call w CHA (Lillian Fuentes) re revitalizing motion
07/10/02	2.00	GTX team mtg
07/11/02	0.50	TC w/CHA (Lillian Fuentes) re Lakefront revitalization motion
07/12/02	2.00	Revitalization motion and w/drawal motion
07/15/02	1.50	Site selection criteria review of Lakefront
07/15/02	0.75	Mtg w JEB re sit selection criteria for Lakefront

DATE 07/15/02	HOURS 1.00	DESCRIPTION Site Selection criteria issues for Lakefront
07/15/02	2.50	Madden/Wells working group mtg
07/15/02	2.75	Mtg w Jennifer O'Neil, CHAC re FSS program
07/15/02	0.50	Follow-up to Jennifer O'Neil mtg
07/16/02	1.00	Revitalizing motion
07/16/02	1.50	Site-specific criteria research for Lakefront
07/16/02	2.00	Mtg w Mary Wiggins re Drexel and Lakefront
07/17/02	1.00	Phone call w Mikki Anderson, Habitat re motion, M/W issues
07/18/02	1.25	Site selection criteria research re Lakefront
07/18/02	3.25	CHA mtg on Lakefront site-selection criteria
07/22/02	0.50	TC w/RLJ re Lakefront site-selection criteria
07/25/02	1.00	Drexel working group meeting
07/26/02	1.00	Revitalization motion
08/02/02	2.50	Site selection criteria research re Lakefront
08/02/02	3.50	Lakefront working group mtg
08/05/02	3.00	Site selection criteria research re Lakefront
08/05/02	0.50	OC w/JEB re site-specific criteria
08/06/02	2.00	Site-specific criteria re Lakefront
08/06/02	`2.00	Mtg w Tamara Dudukovich, TCB re site-specific criteria for M/W
08/06/02	2.00	Site-specific criteria research re Madden/Wells
08/07/02	2.00	GTX team mtg
08/07/02	1.25	Site-specific criteria re Madden/Wells
08/07/02	0.50	Mtg w JEB re Sec. 8 issues

DATE 08/08/02	HOURS 5.00	DESCRIPTION Site-specific criteria (RRC; CHA A & O policy; MTW agreement); OC w/NJB
08/08/02	0.50	Unit # breakdown for M/W, Lakefront and Drexel
08/09/02	0.85	TC w/Habitat (Lawrence Grisham) re site-specific criteria
08/09/02	5.50	Site-specific criteria research for Lakefront and M/W
08/12/02	2.00	Mtg w JEB re site-specific criteria strategy
08/12/02	1.00	Site-specific criteria mtgMel Jackson, Draper and Kramer
08/19/02	2.50	Madden/Wells working group mtg
08/20/02	1.50	Review latest draft of Lakefront Site-selection criteria
08/20/02	1.00	Lakefront site-specific criteriareview latest draft
08/20/02	2.25	Lakefront Site Specific Criteria mtg
08/26/02	2.00	Drexel working group mtg
09/04/02	2.00	GTX team mtg
09/06/02	1.00	Prepare for Lakefront working grp mtg
09/06/02	2.00	Lakefront working group mtg
09/06/02	1.83	OC w/AEG re Social Services at Lakefront
09/09/02	4.50	Site-specific criteria issues re Lakefront, Madden/Wells
09/10/02	0.50	Draft Papers for filing Revitalizing motion for M/W
09/10/02	1.50	Filing M/W Revitalizing motion
09/11/02	0.75	TC w/Lillian Fuentes, CHA re Site-specific criteria for Lakefront, Madden/Wells
09/11/02	2.00	GTX team mtg
09/17/02	2.50	Follow-up on site-specific criteria issues (M/W)
09/17/02	2.00	Review Plan for Transformation FY2003
09/18/02	2.50	Site-specific criteria for Drexel, Lakefront and M/W

DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
09/18/02	1.50	GTX team mtg
09/18/02	2.50	M/W working grp mtg on site-specific criteria
09/19/02	1.50	Site-specific criteria, M/W follow-up
09/23/02	0.50	TC w/Leroy Square, Madden/Wells working group member re social services
09/23/02	0.50	Soc. Services background research
09/24/02	0.50	TC w/RLJ re history of social services at M/W
09/24/02	1.00	Draft Comments on relocation at M/W for AG (for Tom Sullivan mtg)
09/24/02	2.00	Preparation for MacArthur mtg, review social service issues at M/W, Drexel and Lakefront
09/25/02	2.00	Mtg w Heather Parrish, MacArthur Foundation re social service issues at Madden/Wells
09/30/02	1.25	Drexel working group mtg
09/30/02	1.25	Draft Comments on Drexel's tenant-selection plan
09/30/02	0.75	Mtg w Habitat(Lawrence Grisham) re social services and tenant selection plans
10/02/02	1.50	GTX team mtg
10/02/02	2.00	CAFHA mtg
10/04/02	1.50	Review Lakefront Tenant-selection criteria
10/04/02	2.00	Lakefront working group mtg
10/08/02	2.00	Review Lakefront tenant-selection criteria
10/08/02	1.00	TC w/Bob Whitfield, Rich Wheelock re Lakefront tenant-selection criteria
10/08/02	1.00	Review relocation issues at Madden/Wells
10/09/02	2.00	GTX team mtg.

DATE 10/18/02	HOURS 2.00	DESCRIPTION Review Rich Wheelock's comments on Lakefront tenant-selection criteria
10/21/02.	2.50	M/W working group mtg
10/22/02	4.50	Research and Draft Tenant-selection criteria issues for Lakefront
10/24/02	2.00	Draft Lakefront Tenant-Selection criteria issues
10/25/02	1.50	Tenant selection criteria research
10/25/02	2.00	Mtg w AEG re tenant-selection criteria
11/04/02	2.00	Review latest draft of Tenant selection criteria for Lakefront
11/11/02	1.00	Phone call w Lawrence Grisham re tenant selection criteria at Lakefront
11/11/02	1.00	Phone call w Rebecca Ford, Draper & Kramer re tenant selection criteria at Lakefront
11/14/02	1.00	Follow-up w Lawrence Grisham re Lakefront tenant-selection criteria
11/14/02	1.50	Phone call w Rich Wheelock re Lakefront, M/W tenant-selection criteria
11/19/02	1.50	Lakefront Elevator issuecorrespondence w/Lawrence Grisham
11/19/02	0.50	TC w/Rebecca Ford, Draper & Kramer (Lakefront)
11/19/02	2.50	M/W Tenant-Selection criteriaresearch and draft issues
11/20/02	0.50	TC w/Lawrence Grisham re elevators at Lakefront
11/20/02	1.25	Mtg w/Rebecca Ford, D&K re tenant-selection criteria at Lakefront
11/21/02	2.00	Reviewing M/W site-specific draft and documents
11/21/02	2.00	Lakefront tenant-selection draft and issues
11/21/02	5.50	Madden/Wells working group and sit-specific criteria meeting
11/22/02	1.00	TC w/Rebecca Ford, D&K
11/27/02	2.00	GTX team meeting

DATE 12/02/02	HOURS 0.75	DESCRIPTION TC w/Lawrence Grisham re Drexel and Lakefront tenant-selection criteria
12/02/02	4.00	Drexel working group meeting
12/03/02	3.50	Research and draft Elevator Motion for Lakefront
12/03/02	1.50	Draft Lakefront Elevator motion
12/04/02	0.50	OC w/ALP re income tiering at Lakefront
12/04/02	0.25	Tenant selection materials for AG
12/04/02	0.75	Draft Lakefront Elevator Motion
12/04/02	0.50	TC w/Rich Wheelock re income-tiering at Lakefront
12/04/02	2.75	Draft Lakefront Elevator Motion
12/05/02	1.50	Lakefront income tiering issue
12/05/02	0.25	TC w/Jonathan Kaden, Sonnenschein (D&K counsel) re Lakefront income tiering, tenant selection criteria
12/05/02	0.25	TC w/Rebecca Ford, D&K, re Lakefront income tiering, tenant selection criteria
12/11/02	1.00	GTX team mtg
12/12/02	1.50	Review latest Lakefront Tenant Selection Criteria
12/12/02	2.00	Review LCO/CHA family list at Lakefront
12/13/02	2.00	Draft Lakefront Tenant Selection Criteria comments
12/13/02	1.50	Draft Drexel Tenant Selection Criteria comments
12/13/02	1.00	TC w/Rich Wheelock re tenant-selection criteria
12/13/02	0.50	Review new draft of Lakefront criteria
12/13/02	1.50	Mtg. w/ALP, Ald. Preckwinkle re Madden/Wells working group
12/13/02	1.00	Working group follow-up mtg with Lawrence Grisham (Habitat)
12/16/02	4.00	Madden/Wells working group meeting

DATE 12/17/02	HOURS 2.00	DESCRIPTION Draft Lakefront elevator motion
12/19/02	1.50	Draft Lakefront Elevator motion
12/19/02	2.00	Lakefront tenant-selection criteria (phone calls with Rich Wheelock, Sarah Mervine)
12/20/02	2.00	Draft Lakefront elevator motion
12/20/02	1.00	Review latest draft of Lakefront tenant-selection criteria
12/20/02	1.50	TC w/Rich Wheelock re elimination of income-tiering
12/20/02	1.50	Draft memo on elimination of income-tiering
01/02/03	0.50	Phone call to Lillian Fuentes re Lakefront elevator motion
01/03/03	1.00	Lakefront Tenant Selection criteria
01/03/03	1.50	Lakefront income tiering
01/06/03	3.00	Lakefront tenant selection criteria
01/07/03	3.00	Lakefront tenant selection criteria
01/07/03	1.00	Lakefront elevator motion
01/08/03	1.50	Mtg w ALP and JEB re Lakefront tenant selection criteria and income-tiering
01/08/03	2.25	Lakefront tenant selection criteria
01/13/03	4.50	Madden-Wells working group mtg
01/14/03	1.50	Tenant selection criteria re Lakefront
01/15/03	2.00	Lakefront Tenant Selection Criteria issues
01/17/03	2.50	Lakefront Tenant Selection criteria
01/17/03	3.00	Lakefront Working Group mtg
01/21/03	2.00	Lakefront Tenant Selection criteria
01/21/03	2.00	Review court orders on priority ranking of Lakefront families
01/22/03	1.00	Phone calls re income tiering at Lakefront

DATE	НО	URS	DESCRIPTION
01/23/03		1.50	TC w/Eddie Feldman re priority families determination at Lakefront
01/27/03		1.50	Review Drexel Tenant Selection Criteria
01/27/03		2.00	Review Tenant Selection Criteria for Drexel
01/27/03		1.00	Drexel working group mtg
01/27/03		2.00	Mtg. w/Lawrence Grisham, Mikki Anderson at Habitat re social service issues at Madden-Wells
01/28/03		1.00	Prepare Lakefront priority of eligible families issue.
01/28/03		1.00	OC w/ALP re Lakefront issues
01/30/03		1.00	Phone call w Eddie Feldman re Lakefront priority families issues
02/03/03		2.00	Mtg w Habitat re site-selection issues at Lakefront, Drexel and Madden/Wells
02/05/03		2.00	GTX team meeting
02/06/03		1.50	OC w/JEB and HJF re Lakefront, Drexel and M/W
02/07/03		2.00	Lakefront working group mtg
02/07/03		1.50	Lunch meeting with The Community Builders re Madden/Wells site-selection

286.18 Total Hours