IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLINOIS EASTERN DIVISION

DOROTHY GAUTREAUX, et al.,)
Plaintiffs,)
) No. 66 C 1459
VS.)
CHICAGO HOUSING AUTHORITY,)
Defendant)

AFFIDAVIT OF JULIE ELENA BROWN SUPPORTING MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES AGAINST CHA

I, Julie Elena Brown, being duly sworn, say:

- 1. I am one of the attorneys for plaintiffs in <u>Gautreaux v. Chicago Housing</u>

 <u>Authority</u>, Civil Action No. 66 C 1459, in the United States District Court for the Northern District of Illinois.
- 2. I am a graduate of the University of Wisconsin, Madison (B.A., 1979, History and American Institutions, with honors) where I received the Vilas Chancellor's Merit Scholarship. I am also a graduate of the University of Wisconsin Law School (J.D., 1983, cum laude), where I was a member of the Order of the Coif, a member of the University of Wisconsin Law Review and an Editor of the Wisconsin International Law Journal.
- 3. I am admitted to practice in the State of Illinois, the Northern District of Illinois, and the United States Court of Appeals for the Seventh Circuit. I have also practiced before the Illinois Pollution Control Board and the City of Chicago Zoning Board of Appeals.
- 4. Since May 30, 1989, I have been a staff attorney and a salaried employee of Business and Professional People for the Public Interest (BPI). BPI was incorporated as an

Illinois not-for-profit corporation in 1969 and since that time has functioned as a public interest law and policy center.

- 5. Since joining BPI I have had primary and secondary responsibility for a variety of legal proceedings concentrating on housing and environmental matters. I have appeared and actively participated in various matters, including this case and Wallace v. Chicago Housing Authority, Civil Action No. 03 C 0491 (United States District Court for the Northern District of Illinois); Business and Professional People for the Public Interest, et al. v. Commonwealth Edison Co., 87 CH 11098 (Circuit Court of Cook County, Illinois) (punitive damages trial, 1990); People of the State of Illinois, Plaintiffs and Marian Byrnes, et al., Intervening Plaintiffs v. CWM Chemical Services, Inc. and Chemical Waste Management, Inc., 91 CH 04768 (Circuit Court of Cook County, Illinois) (evidentiary hearing on entry of consent decree in environmental enforcement action, 1991); CWM Chemical Service, Inc. v. Environmental Protection Agency, Illinois Pollution Control Board, 89-177 (appeal of hazardous waste disposal permit denial); and In the Matter of Groundwater Quality Standards (35 Ill. Adm. Code 620), Illinois Pollution Control Board, R89-14 (proceedings for the promulgation of statewide groundwater quality standards, 1989-1991).
- 6. From April, 1984 to May 15, 1989, I worked as an Assistant Corporation Counsel for the City of Chicago in the Appeals and Affirmative Litigation Divisions of the Corporation Counsel's office. In that capacity, I had primary and secondary responsibility for a variety of civil matters in the federal trial and appellate court and state trial, appellate and Supreme courts in Illinois, including numerous appeals, and trial matters involving RICO, fraud, contract, environmental and other laws.

- 7. Prior to joining the Corporation Counsel's office, I worked as an attorney for O'Keefe, Ashendon, Lyons & Ward in Chicago on a variety of research matters. During law school I worked as a law clerk at Julian & Olson, a law firm in Madison, Wisconsin, primarily on employment discrimination and criminal defense matters. I also worked during law school as a law clerk at the Wisconsin Department of Justice, Labor and Industry Unit in Madison, Wisconsin, primarily on employment discrimination and Indian Law matters.
- 8. I have worked on the <u>Gautreaux</u> litigation continuously since 1990. Under Alexander Polikoff's general supervision, I have had responsibilities relating to nearly all aspects of the litigation during this time period, as reflected in the attached Exhibit A.
- 9. BPI has an understanding with its salaried attorneys (including me) that any attorneys' fees awarded for their services will be paid to the organization and not to the individual attorneys. Any fees awarded for my services in this case will be paid to BPI.
- spent in contemporaneous daily time records. I have prepared a written record (set forth in Exhibit A hereto) of the professional time that I have spent from July 31, 2001 through July 31, 2003. This written record is based upon time records that I maintained for that period. Where my records were not complete, I supplemented them with other contemporaneous materials, such as meeting notes, my daily calendars, and contemporaneous time records of my colleagues. I did not record, nor did I set forth in Exhibit A, numerous instances in which I spent less than 15 minutes on tasks (such as telephone calls and brief discussions) related to this case. I have also eliminated time spent on a number of matters related to this case for which I did not believe an award of attorneys' fees would be appropriate. The number of hours of professional time which I have spent on this case thus substantially exceeds the number of hours set forth in Exhibit A.

Further affiant sayeth not.

Mu Elm. Br

Subscribed and Sworn to before me this 30 th day of December

Notary Public

PAULA KRUGER
Notary Public, State of Illinois
My Commission Expires Feb. 16, 2004

DATE	HOL	JRS	DESCRIPTION
08/01/01		1.25	Mtg. w/Habitat redevelopment staff re revitalizing area process and costs
08/01/01		1.75	GTX redevelopment team mtg.
08/01/01		2.00	Mtg. w/CHA legal re TSAP and Transfer Policy
08/01/01		0.50	OC w/ALP re scattered sites pvt mgrs mtgs.; revise letter to Lillian Fuentes re same
08/01/01		0.50	Revise Leadership Council contract memo and OC w/ALP re strategy for start up of Leadership Council contract
08/02/01		7.25	Occupancy Dept. mapping session w/CHA and CHAC staff
08/06/01		0.75	Review Cabrini motion; OC w/NJB and ALP re same
08/06/01		0.75	Revise and finalize letter to Lillian Fuentes re scattered sites
08/06/01		0.75	Prep for GTX team memo re issues raised at Occupancy Dept. mapping session
08/06/01		2.25	Mtg. w/Leadership Council and ALP re new GTX program startup
08/08/01		0.25	OC w/ALP re mtg. w/Leadership Council and CHA on new GTX program
08/09/01		0.50	Draft and revise letter to scattered sites mgrs re statistics
08/09/01		0.50	TC w/Courtney Minor and draft and revise letter to CHA regarding use of capital bonds for rehab of scattered sites
08/09/01		0.50	Review CHA briefing packet
08/09/01		0.25	Review RHI agreement draft
08/13/01		0.75	TC w/Courtney Minor re scattered sites bond OK; finalize letter re scattered sites bond OK; OC w/ALP re same; finalize letter to scattered sites pvt mgrs re info request
08/13/01		1.25	Draft and revise memo to GTX team re issues arising in Occupancy Dept. mapping
08/13/01		0.25	TC w/Mary Davis re LC contract and GTX program startup

DATE 08/13/01	HOURS 1.00	DESCRIPTION Review RHI agreement draft; OC w/ALP re same; review materials re Project-Based sec. 8
08/15/01	1.25	GTX team mtg.
08/15/01	0.50	Finalize GTX team memo re Occupancy Dept. issues
08/15/01	1.00	Mtg. w/MPC and Jo Patton re RHI program
08/16/01	0.50	OC w/GTX team re judgment order restriction on families above the third floor
08/16/01	0.25	TCs w/Lillian Fuentes re scattered sites letters and response; memo to ALP re same
08/16/01	0.50	Review MPC info re RHI
08/16/01	0.25	Portability case research
08/16/01	0.50	Memo to ALP re new GTX program issues; OC w/AEG re GTX program and right of return
08/28/01	0.50	Review and revise Cabrini height waiver motion
08/28/01	0.25	OC w/ALP re updates on GTX program discussions with CHA and Leadership Council
08/29/01	0.25	OC w/ALP, EHM, NJB re relocation strategy
08/29/01	0.25	Mtg. w/Karl Miller (CHA) re pre-GTX scattered site list
08/29/01	0.75	GTX team mtg. re prep for relocation committee meeting; team meeting re prep for relocation procedures drafting comm. meeting
08/29/01	0.75	Review transformation plan funding analysis
08/29/01	1.75	Mobility counselor's roundtable
08/30/01	1.25	Mtg. w/ALP, AEG, NJB and JMK re relocation process
08/30/01	0.75	GTX team meeting re financing
09/04/01	0.25	Review new GTX program draft announcement and TC w/ALP re comments
09/05/01	0.25	OC w/JMK re ABLA relocation letters and follow-up

1	DATE 09/05/01	HOURS 0.50	DESCRIPTION TC w/Mary Davis re GTX program flyer and other arrangements for GTX program; review revised flyer
	09/06/01	0.25	OC w/JMK re ABLA relocation letters and follow-up
	09/06/01	1.00	OC w/ALP re revised flyer for new GTX program; TC w/Mary Davis re same; TCs w/Mary Davis and Aurie Pennick and ALP re RHI project based program and relationship to new GTX program; OC w/Jo Patton re same
	09/09/01	0.75	Review Year 3 Plan for Transformation draft
	09/12/01	1.00	Visit to UJIMA and tour of Kenwood-Oakland scattered site area and proposed revitalization area expansion for Hearts United III
	09/12/01	1.00	GTX team mtg. re redev and Transformation Plan status
	09/13/01	2.50	Review YR 3 transformation plan
	.09/13/01	1.50	Review data from pvt mgrs re scattered site residents; prep for and mtg. w/ALP rescattered sites strategy;
	09/14/01	2.25	Prep for and mtg. w/GTX team re Yr 3 transformation plan draft and comments
	09/14/01	1.00	TC w/Lillian Fuentes rescattered sites information; draft follow-up letter to Lillian; cs/ALP re same
	09/14/01	1.25	Review RRC language re section 8; review ALP draft revision for new GTX program contract and revise draft; TC w/Steven Dailley (MPC) re RHI meeting; OC w/BV re research re section 8 requirements of RRC and CHAC contract
	09/17/01	4.00	Review transformation plans, MTW agreement and UI relocation reports for analysis of Year 3 plan
	09/19/01	2.25	Mtg. w/Habitat and RLJ/NJB/ALP re Year 3 planning and financing
	09/19/01	2.00	OC w/BV re fair housing workshop for mobility counselors and portability research assignment; review CHAC materials; OC w/ALP re memo on CHAC materials and next steps; review Year 3 plan for Section 8 comments
	09/21/01	0.25	TC w/ALP re follow up on scattered sites
	09/24/01	0.50	TC w/Lillian Fuentes (CHA) rescattered sites mtgs.; TC w/ALP re same

DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
09/24/01	3.00	Review UI reports on relocation
09/26/01	0.75	OC w/Lisa Schneider re Year 3 Plan and MTW agreement; OC w/AEG and ALP re same
09/26/01	0.25	TC w/Lillian Fuentes rescattered sites mtgs.; OC w/ALP re same
09/26/01	1.25	Relocation counselors' roundtable
09/26/01	0.25	TC w/Mary Davis re GTX program registration
09/30/01	1.50	Review draft UI report on CHAC programs
10/01/01	1.00	Review Changing Patterns relocation counseling materials
10/01/01	1.75	Mtg. w/CHA, LC and MPC re RHI program and relationship to new GTX program
10/01/01	0.25	TC w/ALP re UI draft report and CHAC
10/01/01	2.00	Mtg. w/Jennifer O'Neil re CHAC programs and review materials
10/03/01	0.25	OC w/ALP re CHAC meeting and issues re new GTX program; TCs to CHA to get info on new GTX program flyer mailing; TC w/Mary Davis re right of return for new GTX program participants
10/04/01	0.50	TC w/Mary Davis; TC w/Tiffany Jimerson (Leadership Council); OC w/ALP all re new GTX program; review flyer and contract re eligibility
10/08/01	1.25	Prep. summary of scattered sites mtgs.
10/08/01	0.25	TC w/Mary Davis; TC w/ALP (voice mail) re new GTX program; research re new GTX program mailing
10/09/01	0.25	Prep for mtg. w/CHA re proposed HUD waivers for Transformation Plan
10/10/01	2.00	Mtg. w/CHA and ALP re proposed HUD waivers; OCs w/ALP, AEG and RLJ re same $$
10/10/01	0.50	OC w/ALP re prep for scattered sites mtg. w/CHA on 10/11
10/10/01	2.00	Prep for and mtg with AEG and ALP re relocation numbers for Year 3; TP financing and project based sec. 8; discussion of use of GTX \$20 mil. and redevelopment reports

DATE 10/10/01	HOURS 1.50	DESCRIPTION Revise summary of mtgs with scattered sites pvt mgrs.
10/10/01	0.25	OC w/BV re portability issues; OC w/AEG re CHAC; memo re flyer for new GTX program
10/11/01	4.50	Prep for meeting on scattered sites; Mtr. w/CHA re scattered sites; OC w/ALP rescattered sites mtg and follow-up, draft follow-up letter to CHA all re scattered sites; revise memo summary of scattered sites mtgs with pvt mgrs
10/15/01	1.00	Revise letter to Lillian Fuentes (CHA) re 10/11 meeting on scattered sites
10/15/01	2.00	Revise memo re scattered site mtgs.
10/17/01	1.00	OC w/Hoy/AEG/ALP/NJB re TP financing
10/17/01	0.50	Prep for financing meeting
10/17/01	1.00	Review ALP comments and revise and finalize letter to CHA rescattered sites meeting; OC w/ALP re same
10/22/01	0.25	TC w/ALP re portability issues and Beth Valukas memo
10/24/01	1.50	GTX team mtg.
10/25/01	2.00	Make transfer procedure edits and send to CHA; TC w/Robyn DM re transfer procedures and process for A&O rewrite
10/25/01	1.00	Review revised financing memo
10/25/01	0.25	OC w/ALP, TC w/Janice Bryson re whether local preferences apply to Community area outreach
10/25/01	0.25	TC w/Mary Davis (with ALP) re new GTX program
11/05/01	0.50	TCs w/Tiffany Jemerson (LC) and memo to ALP and BV re new GTX program registration
12/03/01	1.00	Revise letter to John Jensen re portability; TC w/Chris Klepper re letter to Jensen; memo to ALP re CHAC mobility programs
12/04/01	1.00	Letter to CHA rescattered sites follow-up; OC w/ALP rescattered sites; TC w/Tom Johnson rescattered sites and order re waiting list units;
12/05/01	1.25	GTX team meeting

DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
12/05/01	0.50	OCs w/AEG re relocation resources for families in Horner Phase II
12/05/01	3.00	OC w/ALP re new CHA counseling RFP and prep for mtg. w/HUD lawyers; meet with HUD lawyers; mtg. w/ALP and BV re next steps following mtg. w/HUD
12/06/01	0.75	OC w/ALP/BV re mtg. at HUD
12/10/01	0.50	Review LCO motion to intervene
12/10/01	0.50	Review Nick Brunick memo re financing transformation plan
12/10/01	0.25	Review CHAC mobility program interim report
12/17/01	2.00	Review ALP memo re mobility counseling; OC w/AEG, OC w/ALP and AEG re same; Review revised memo
12/17/01	0.50	Review mobility program assessment
12/19/01	1.00	Review Year 3 plan re HOPE VI applications and TC w/Lawrence Grisham re same
12/19/01	1.00	Review mobility counseling memo re CHA relocation and OC w/AEG re same
12/20/01	0.50	Review report on CHAC mobility program
01/07/02	1.00	Review draft transfer procedures and comment; TC w/Robyn Delaney-Morton; TC w/Rich Wheelock re same
01/07/02	0.25	OC w/AEG re counseling RFP
01/08/02	1.00	Review counseling RFP issues and leave TC w/comments for AEG
01/09/02	2.75	Revise memo rescattered sites mtgs.; OC w/ALP in prep for scattered sites mtg. w/CHA and private managers; review data from scattered sites mtgs.; prep agenda for CHA scattered sites meeting
01/09/02	1.75	OC w/BV re Section 8 flow chart; review chart and comment; c/AEG and c/ALP and AEG re mobility counseling
01/10/02	3.00	Mtg. w/CHA and scattered sites private managers re relocation issues, racial harassment issues, rehab program; TC w/Rich Wheelock re placing relocatees in vacant scattered site and OC w/ALP re same

DATE 01/10/02	HOURS 2.00	
01/14/02	0.75	Review ALP memo rescattered sites meeting; TC w/Lillian Fuentes re holding scattered sites units vacant for relocatees
01/16/02	1.50	Mtg. w/Habitat re Plan financing issues
01/16/02	1.00	OC w/ALP re holding scattered sites vacant for relocatees during 90 day notice period; research re same
01/17/02	2.50	Prep for and mtg. w/Lillian Fuentes re scattered sites rehab, relocation and service connector issues
01/23/02	1.75	GTX team mtg.
01/23/02	1.25	Letter to CHA re scattered sites meeting and OC w/ALP re same
01/24/02	0.25	OC w/RLJ/ALP re vacancies in Kenwood-Oakland and scattered sites
01/24/02	1.50	Finalize letter to Lillian Fuentes re scattered site issues; memo to ALP re vacancies in scattered sites; TC w/Rich Wheelock re filling scattered site vacancies prior to HCS lottery being completed; TC w/Meghan Harte re same
01/29/02	0.50	OC w/ALP and Valukas re mobility issues
01/31/02	0.25	TC w/Lillian Fuentes re scattered sites rehab program and relocation and OC w/ALP re same
02/06/02	1.25	GTX team meeting
02/07/02	0.75	Mtg. w/ALP, AEG, BV, Jennifer O'Neill and Bill Riley re mobility in CHAC programs
02/20/02	0.50	OC w/JEB, ALP and BV re Section 8 and social services issues
02/20/02	1.00	GTX team meeting including discussion of offsite development strategy
02/20/02	3.00	Mtg. w/ALP and Leadership Council re new GTX program; review draft letter to Meghan Harte re Tues. meeting; review relocation rights contract re definition of lease compliance
02/21/02	2.00	letter to Meghan Harte re reviewing section 8 program re mobility; OC w/ALP and AEG re mobility booth presentation and review MH draft re same; review drafts of letter to MH re new GTX program meeting and OC w/ALP re relocation contract language

DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
02/25/02	0.50	OCs w/AEG and LR re using GTX \$\$ for land acquisition;
02/25/02	0.25	Review marketing report from NW scattered sites
02/25/02	1.00	OC w/BV re mobility next steps; review research on Sec. 8 opp. area poverty level
02/27/02	0.50	Review correspondence on scattered sites and draft letter to Lillian
02/28/02	2.00	OC w/ALP re memo re 23.49% standard;OC w/BV re same and related research assignments;OC w/BV re letter to HUD re Sec. 8 portability issues; review fax from Chris Klepper re opportunity areas under different definitions
03/06/02	0.25	Scattered sites strategy: cs/ ALP and discussion re scattered sites relocation without lottery; TC w/Meghan Harte re relocation into scattered sites
03/06/02	0.75	Mtg. w/Lawrence Grisham
03/07/02	4.00	Prep for conference call re scattered sites; TC w/ALP re same; TC w/Lillian Fuentes re scattered sites; TC w/Meghan Harte re same; TC w/ALP re call; memo re call re scattered sites; review transfer policy re scattered sites concerns
03/11/02	1.00	Review transfer policy; TC w/Lillian re same
03/14/02	0.25	Revise scattered sites memo re relocation plan and rehab program
03/18/02	1.75	Review transfer policy; TC w/Lillian Fuentes re same; TC w/AEG re scattered site residents and need for housing choice surveys; finalize memo on scattered site conversations with CHA
03/20/02	0.75	OC w/ALP re HCS for scattered sites residents; finalize letter to CHA re same
03/20/02	0.75	GTX team meeting
03/20/02	1.00	Review research re low poverty area definitions
03/21/02	2.00	Review deconcentration reg.; Review low poverty data and OC w/ALP re low poverty standard for Section 8; Review ALP memo re same
03/28/02	2.50	Scattered sites meeting and prep therefor; OC w/ALP re same after meeting

DATE 04/01/02	HOURS 0.50	DESCRIPTION Review memo and OC w/AEG re opportunity area definition
04/10/02	1.00	Review memo re Sec. 8 clustering and OC w/Lauren Raphael re same; TC w/Chris Klepper
04/10/02	1.00	GTX team meeting
04/11/02	1.00	TC w/Chris Klepper re Sec. 8 mtgs.; , TC w/Diane Prince (LC) re new GTX program and OC w/AEG and ALP re same
04/22/02	1.00	Review CHA annual report
04/22/02	0.50	OC w/AEG re follow up on habitability declarations
04/22/02	0.50	OC w/AEG re Horner vacancy issues and review draft letter to Lillian Fuentes
04/22/02	2.50	Review LCBH report on discrimination against HCV holders; check on new GTX program briefing
04/24/02	4.50	New GTX program briefing and comments for memo
04/25/02	3.00	Review CRA lawsuit documents; OC w/NJB and AEG re history of the CRA lawsuit and jurisdictional arguments in HOPE VI litigation
04/29/02	1.25	Review CHA annual report
04/29/02	1.00	Review Receiver's status report
05/01/02	1.00	Review CHA annual report
05/01/02	1.00	OC w/ALP re CRA lawsuit appeal;OC w/NJB re same; ts/Eddie Feldman re same
05/01/02	0.50	OC w/AEG re use of GTX funds for Maplewood Courts
05/01/02	1.50	Memo re GTX. II briefing
05/01/02	1.00	Review study re discrimination against HCV holders
05/02/02	0.50	TC w/Darlene Ellis re scattered sites CAWL problem; OC w/ALP re same; OC w/AEG re same
05/02/02	0.75	Finalize memo re GTX II briefing
05/06/02	0.25	TCs re scattered sites to Lillian Fuentes and Karl Miller

DATE 05/06/02	HOURS 0.25	DESCRIPTION TC w/Tom Johnson and Eddie Feldman re CRA lawsuit
05/06/02	0.25	OC w/NJB and TC w/Brian Ellison re Cabrini midrise waivers
05/06/02	0.25	TCs w/Leadership Council re GTX II program
05/08/02	1.00	TC w/Lillian Fuentes; ts/Karl Miller re scattered sites and re Darlene Elllis problems with CAWL (scattered sites)
05/08/02	1.00	Prep for and c/call with NJB, EWF and Tom Johnson re CRA lawsuit relocation issues
05/09/02	0.25	OC w/AEG/ALP re low poverty areas
05/13/02	0.25	TC w/Lillian Fuentes re scattered sites: Darlene Ellis follow up and rehab list
05/13/02	0.50	TCs w/Lawrence Grisham re Hearts United II orders; memo to GTX team re same; search for relevant documents and send to Habitat
05/13/02	3.00	Review letter from Bill Wilen re ABLA; OC w/NJB re same; memo to NJB and ALP re same; review CRA lawsuit documents; TC w/Tom Johnson re same;
05/15/02	1.50	GTX team meeting
05/15/02	0.25	Review ABLA plan exec. summary for litigation meeting
05/15/02	2.50	OC w/ALP and NJB re ABLA; TC w/EWF re ABLA meeting; review CRA lawsuit docs
05/15/02	0.25	OC w/ALP re new GTX program
05/16/02	4.25	Prep for and pre-mtg. w/EWF and Tom Johnson and NJB re CRA lawsuit meeting; mtg. w/Bill Wilen, Clyde Murphy, Kate Walz and above re CRA lawsuit; OC w/ALP and NJB re follow strategy to meeting; TC w/EWF re CRA lawsuit appeal strategy.
05/16/02	1.75	Prep for and mtg. w/Mary Davis and Diane Prince re new GTX program; OC w/ALP re same
05/20/02	2.00	TC w/Bill Wilen re CRA lawsuit negotiations; ts/EWF and TJ re same; OC w/NJB re letter to Bill Wilen re ABLA; review Telesis financial analysis; review draft letter to BW re ABLA plan proposal; memos re TC w/calls to Bill Wilen and EWF

DATE 05/20/02		DESCRIPTION Review annual report and TC w/Rich Wheelock re property specific requirements and CHA committee re same
05/20/02	2.50	Review research memo re clustering in Sec. 8;OC w/LR re same
05/20/02	0.25	Review annual report and plan re proj. based sec. 8 and memo to ALP re same
05/21/02	0.50	Revise letter to ABLA pl. counsel; TC w/NJB re same
05/22/02	1.50	Review draft letter and OC w/NJB re letter to Bill Wilen on ABLA plan; TC w/BW re proposed order on CRA lawsuit procedures; OC w/ALP and NJB re all of above; TC w/TJ re above; TC w/EWF re above
05/22/02	0.25	Review draft order re amending tenant assignment plan to allow relocatees in waiting list units
05/22/02	0.25	OC w/ALP and AEG re questions for Meghan Harte re relocation contracting and section 8
05/23/02	0.75	TC w/AEG and ALP re mtg. w/Habitat and CHA re redevelopment planning, re sec. 8 working group and 23.49% in relocation contract; and OC w/AEG re research on tenant participation in governance of mixed income developments
05/23/02	1.00	TCs w/EWF re ABLA proposed order and letter to petitioners re ABLA planning proposal; OC w/NJB re same and re procedures to respond to ABLA petitioners; TC w/BW re same
05/23/02	0.25	OC w/Sarah London re sec. 8 clustering research
05/23/02	1.00	Review LC memo re research on GTX program; TC w/Diane Prince re meeting re same; TC w/ALP re same
05/29/02	1.00	GTX team meeting
05/29/02	2.00	TCs w/BW, TJ, EWF re ABLA order; OC w/ALP, NJB re same
05/29/02	0.25	TCs w/TJ re scattered site agreed order on tenant assignment
05/29/02	0.50	OC w/AEG, review docs re Horner meeting re consent decree issues
05/30/02	1.50	Research re scattered sites complaints ; TC w/Janice Byron re same; review memo from HRC re same; OC w/ALP, OC w/Hoy re same

DATE 05/30/02	HOURS 2.00	DESCRIPTION TCs w/Bob Whitfield re transfer procedure to scattered sites; ts/ Tom Johnson re agreed order on scattered sites tenant assignment; review CHA correspondence re scattered sites; tenant assignment order; OC w/ALP re above
06/03/02	0.50	OC w/EHM; OC w/NJB re GTX motion re new map; review materials re same
06/05/02	0.25	Review letter from CAC to CHA re prop. specific screening committee
06/05/02	0.50	Review draft order re scattered sites relocation and revised tenant assignment procedure
06/05/02	0.50	OCs w/ALP; TC w/Mary Davis re meeting regarding NU research in GTX II; OC w/Jean Caruso re research on HUD obligation to aff. further fair housing;
06/06/02	0.25	Finalize letter to Jim Yeaman re HRC scattered sites family complaints
06/06/02	2.00	Review correspondence on scattered sites amend. to TSAP; TC w/Janice Byron re pvt mgt screening; review draft order; C w/Meghan Harte re transfer list; TC w/Tom Johnson
06/06/02	3.00	C w/Susan Lloyd; LC (MD and AP); Meghan Harte; ALP re GTX II evaluation; TC w/Mary Davis and OC w/ALP re same; OC w/AEG re same
06/06/02	0.25	TC w/Chris Klepper re 23.49%
06/10/02	1.00	Research and TC w/Lillian Fuentes re A&O update; OC w/EHM re same
06/10/02	0.50	OC w/NJB re scattered sites habitability issues; memo to ALP re same;
06/10/02	0.75	OC w/EHM re mtg. w/CHA, LC and Susan Lloyd on GTX II; review ALP notes re agenda for upcoming counselors meeting;OC w/AEG re same
06/10/02	2.00	Research re EAH and project based Sec. 8 programs; OC w/MA re same
06/12/02	0.25	OC w/ALP re scattered sites issues
06/12/02	1.25	GTX team meeting

DATE 06/12/02	HOURS 0.75	DESCRIPTION Review CHA transfer procedures for GTX issues and compare with last edits;
06/13/02	0.25	TC w/Tom Johnson re draft of transfer procedure
06/13/02	0.25	Review ALP notes re agenda for meeting of mobility counselors
06/13/02	2.25	Prep for and mtg. w/Robin Snyderman and MA re Metrolinks, RHI and other Sec. 8 programs; review Sec. 8 portion of Millennial Housing Commission report
06/17/02	0.50	Review letter from Adele White McCoy re development in KO; cs/AEG; OC w/MA re same
06/17/02	1.25	Review MPC fact sheet on relocation; Review MTW docs
06/17/02	1.00	TC w/Mary Davis re GTX II research problems; TC w/ALP re same
06/18/02	0.75	Review census report on integration; Review docs re Catholic Church welcoming program with LC
06/19/02	0.50	TCs w/Bob Whitfield re scattered sites habitability and relocation procedures
06/19/02	0.25	Review draft transfer procedures
06/19/02	3.50	OC w/ALP re mtg. w/LC on GTX II; TC w/Mary Davis and TC w/John Lukehart re GTX II; OC w/AEG and ALP and MA re meeting re mobility in CHAC contract
06/20/02	0.25	OC w/ALP re TC w/Bob Whitfield re Willie Burrel complaints re rehab and re mtg. w/CHA re rehab relocation procedures
06/20/02	1.50	Review scattered sites rehab reports; OC w/ALP re same and next steps; TC w/Lillian Fuentes re same
06/20/02	0.50	OC w/NJB re CRA lawsuit next steps; messages to EWF re same; c/ Clyde Murphy and Sharon Legenza re same
06/20/02	0.25	TC w/Lillian Fuentes re transfer procedure comments
06/20/02	0.50	cs/Jeanne Caruso, c/ALP re aff. admin research
06/24/02	1.00	TC w/Tom Johnson re draft of TSAP order and transfer list issues; research re transfer list doc.; review draft order
06/24/02	0.25	Review ALP letter re Horner counseling arrangements and contract

DAT	E	HOI	JRS	DESCRIPTION
06/	/24/02		0.75	OCs w/Jeanne Caruso re aff. admin research
06/	/26/02		1.75	GTX team meeting
06/	26/02		0.75	Pre-meeting re mtg. w/CHA re CHAC contract mobility provisions
06/	26/02		1.75	Mtg. w/Megan Harte and Gail Niemann re CHAC contract mobility provisions and Horner vacancies
06/	27/02		0.25	Review scattered sites rehab docs and voice mail to Lillian Fuentes re need for updated vacancy list
06/	27/02		0.25	OC w/ALP re LC Horner arrangements and research re same
06/	27/02		0.25	Review new draft of transfer procedures and reply to Lillian Fuentes re same
06/	27/02		1.00	Review of draft scattered sites relocation order and memo to Tom Johnson and ALP re same
06/	27/02		0.50	OC w/AEG re FSS and research re same
07/	10/02		2.00	GTX team meeting
07/	10/02		0.25	Review notes re scattered sites relocation order; OC w/ALP re same
07/	10/02		1.50	C w/Chris Klepper and John Lukehart re 23.49% and mobility strategy
07/	12/02		0.50	Review draft of site specific criteria for Lakefront development
07/	12/02		0.25	OC w/MA re site specific criteria
07/	12/02		0.25	OC w/ALP and C w/TJ re scattered sites relocation order
07/	15/02		0.25	TC w/Herb Ziegeldorf (HUD) re steering complaint against HRC
07/	15/02		1.00	Review draft site specific criteria for Lakefront development and OC w/MA re same
07/	15/02		0.25	OC w/ALP re scattered sites relocation order
07/	15/02		1.00	OCs w/AEG re work requirements at mixed income developments
07/	15/02		0.25	TC w/Bob Whitfield re site specific criteria

DATE 07/15/02	HOURS 3.50	DESCRIPTION OC w/MA re mtg. w/Jennifer O'Neil on FSS program; review memo re same; review HUD evaluation of CHAC FSS program; review CBPP article on FSS
07/17/02	0.25	Review research re aff. adm. in sec. 8
07/18/02	0.50	Review scattered sites files; TC w/Lillian Fuentes re follow up on Darlene Ellis scattered sites problems and on rehab and vacancy reports; TC w/Tom Johnson re relocation order.
07/18/02	0.25	TC w/Bob Whitfield re scattered sites as relocation resources
07/18/02	0.75	Prep for and OC w/Jeanne Caruso re research on aff. adm. of sec. 8 program
07/18/02	1.00	Review research on Section 8 clustering and background documents
07/22/02	0.75	Review CHA demographic info; TC w/Lillian Fuentes re scattered sites vacancies based on demo. info
07/22/02	0.75	Review HRA expansion order; OC w/AEG re same
07/22/02	0.75	TC w/Tom Johnson re revisions to scattered sites relocation order
07/22/02	0.50	Review Whitfield letter re site specific criteria; OC w/MA re same
07/22/02	1.00	Review HUD regs and guidelines re SEMAP and mobility
07/24/02	0.50	Review Receivers quarterly report
07/24/02	2.25	Review and revise scattered sites relocation order; OC w/ALP re same; ts/ Bob Whitfield and Megan Harte re use of scattered sites as temporary relocation resources; OC w/ALP re same
07/24/02	0.25	Review CBPP FSS report
07/24/02	2.00	Team meeting re GTX strategy
07/25/02	0.50	TC w/Darlene Ellis re scattered sites waiting list problem; notes and TC w/Lillian Fuentes re same
07/25/02	0.75	OC w/MA re revitalization motions and scheduling of these, relocation and substitution motions; TC w/Tom Johnson and email TJ re same; OC w/ALP re same
07/25/02	0.50	Review Bob Whitfield letters on scattered sites as relocation resources; TC w/BW re same; OC w/ALP re same

DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
07/25/02	0.75	OC w/MA re meeting on service connector strategy and review research on Madden Wells service connector
07/29/02	0.50	Review HUD complaint re HRC and attached documents
07/29/02	0.50	OC w/AEG re GTX concerns in physical planning
07/29/02	0.25	OC w/AEG re new contractors and Round 2 relocation
07/29/02	1.00	TC w/Chris Klepper re research on restricting use of HCVs in mobility programs; OC w/MA re research re same
07/29/02	3.00	Research on mobility programs, nationally and policy reports on same
07/30/02	1.00	Research on clustering and impact of Sec. 8 on neighborhoods
08/01/02	1.50	Review draft of Lakefront revitalization order; OC w/ALP, OC w/MA re same
08/01/02	0.25	TC w/EWF re CRA lawsuit and sec. 8 mtgs.
08/01/02	2.50	Mtg. w/Bob Whitfield and Rich Wheelock and AEG, ALP re relocation and development issues and BPI follow-up discussion
08/01/02	0.75	Review correspondence with CHA re mobility and OC w/ALP re same; Review draft of letter to CHA re same
08/05/02	0.25	TC w/Tom Johnson and send revisions for scattered sites relocation order
08/05/02	3.50	Review draft Madden Wells site specific criteria; OC w/MA, NJB and AEG re same
08/07/02	0.50	Review Urban Institute relocation counseling assessment
08/07/02	1.75	GTX team meeting re mobility strategy and general Plan strategy
08/08/02	1.50	OC w/MA re site specific criteria
08/08/02	0.25	OC w/MA re site specific criteria
08/08/02	0.50	Review Popkin report on Relocation
08/08/02	1.25	TC w/Mary Davis and Aurie Pennick re GTX 2 and research issues; review correspondence re same; OC w/AEG re same

DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
08/08/02	0.50	TC w/Sue Popkin and Palak Shah re mobility counseling program research
08/12/02	1.25	Review Popkin report on relocation
08/12/02	0.25	TC w/ALP re GTX 2 program
08/12/02	0.75	TC w/Mary Davis re GTX 2 program and research issues
08/14/02	0.25	OC w/AEG re Horner revitalization order
08/14/02	1.00	Review new draft of scattered sites relocation order and transfer list; TC w/Tom Johnson re same
08/15/02	0.50	OC w/HJF re GTX map motion; TC w/Lillian Fuentes re same
08/15/02	0.75	Final revisions to scattered sites relocation order
08/15/02	0.50	OC w/Palak Shah re Sec. 8 mobility research
08/26/02	0.75	Review draft map motion and OC w/HJF re same
08/26/02	3.00	Finalize and file scattered sites relocation motion; ts Tom Johnson re same
08/28/02	0.25	Review new draft of map order
08/28/02	0.50	Follow-up on relocation motion
08/29/02	1.25	Research and OC w/ALP re census tracts 806 and 807 and new census data; OC w/HJF re motion re new GTX map; TC w/Tom Johnson re new map memo
08/29/02	1.50	TCs re scattered sites relocation order; TC w/Lillian re scattered sites vacancy report and getting info in new order to mgrs and CHA staff and re transfer list; TC w/Bob Whitfield re transfer list and scattered sites transfer procedures
08/29/02	0.50	OC w/Palak Shah re research into mobility programs elsewhere in the country
09/04/02	0.50	Review FMR research and OC w/MA re same
09/04/02	2.50	HUD mobility research (national)
09/04/02	2.00	GTX team meeting

DATE		HOURS	DESCRIPTION
09/0	5/02	0.50	Review year 4 Plan
09/0	5/02	1.50	Research for Proj. Based section 8 position letter
09/0	5/02	0.75	Research re LCO MOA for MA
09/0	5/02	0.25	OC w/Palak Shah re research on mobility programs
09/09	9/02	0.75	Review Year 4 plan
09/09	9/02	0.75	Research and draft letter to CHA re proj. based sec. 8
09/10	0/02	0.75	Review Year 4 Plan
09/1	1/02	2.00	GTX team meeting re working group strategy, Year 4 Plan and relocation issues
09/12	2/02	3.00	Research re Proj based section 8 and draft letter to CHA
09/12	2/02	0.75	OC w/EPL re research on mobility counseling programs around the country
09/16	6/02	0.50	Revise Proj. based sec. 8 letter to CHA
09/16	6/02	0.25	Review memo re site specific criteria
09/16	6/02	0.50	Review Palak Shaw memo re mobility counseling programs around the country
09/18	3/02	1.50	GTX team meeting re site specific criteria and the Year 4 plan
09/18	3/02	1.00	Research and drafting re Proj. based sec. 8 letter
09/18	3/02	0.50	Review final FMR memo and comments to MA
09/19	9/02	0.50	Analyze year 4 plan
09/19	9/02	1.00	HCV program research, memo re low pov. def and memo re national housing policy re sec. 8
09/25	5/02	2.00	Prep for and mtg with Leadership Council re GTX II and Horner relocation programs
09/26	6/02	0.75	Review draft Year 4 comments; OC w/ALP re same; OC w/ALP re Year 4 plan analysis
09/30)/02	0.50	OC w/EHM and TC w/ALP re Year 4 comments

DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
09/30/02	0.50	Review CAC comments on Year 4 plan and occupancy analysis
09/30/02	1.00	Project based section 8 memo and review of Gail Niemann letter
09/30/02	1.25	TC w/ALP; OC w/EHM; OC w/MA; OC w/EPL re section 8 mobility strategy
09/30/02	0.25	Review ALP comments on Goetz paper on mobility programs
10/02/02	1.50	GTX team meeting
10/02/02	3.00	Mtg. w/Leadership Council (MD and AP and DP) re developing model opportunity counseling program
10/03/02	2.00	Research re Proj. Based section 8 orders
10/09/02	2.00	Analysis of year 4 plan and CAC and NCPL comments
10/14/02	0.50	Review Tom Sullivan report
10/30/02	1.25	TC w/CHA, ALP re Hearts United
11/27/02	2.00	GTX team mtg.
12/05/02	0.50	C w/MEA re FMR research
12/05/02	0.25	Review memos re GTX II program and NU
12/11/02	1.00	GTX team meeting
12/16/02	2.50	Finish analysis and finalize letter to CHA re scattered sites report
12/16/02	0.50	Review CHAC report
01/09/03	1.50	Mtg. w/ABLA pls attys re settlement (w/ALP)
01/14/03	1.50	Review Sullivan report;Review revised opportunity program summary
01/14/03	1.50	Review Sullivan report
01/15/03	0.50	Review Sullivan report
01/16/03	0.25	OC w/ALP re CRA lawsuit
02/04/03	0.25	Review letter re project based sec. 8

DATE 02/05/03	HOURS 2.00	DESCRIPTION Mtg. w/Habitat (Lawrence and Micki) re M/W, Lakefront and Drexel with HJF and MA
02/05/03	2.00	GTX team meeting
02/06/03	1.50	OC w/MA and HJF re Lakefront, Drexel and M/W
02/10/03	0.25	OC w/HJF re 2000 census data re Proj. based sec. 8 letter and review census info re same
02/10/03	0.25	Review scattered sites report and cover letter
02/10/03	0.25	OC w/HJF re Lakefront tenant screening criteria
02/12/03	0.50	OC w/HJF re MW senior building meeting and issues; TC w/Lawrence Grisham re Habitat tour of Lakefront and MW area.
02/13/03	0.75	OC w/HJF; TC w/LG and MA re pulling of developer at MW; memo to ALP re same
02/17/03	3.00	Tour of M/W, Lakefront, Drexel and Hearts United area and discussion with Lawrence and Mikki re same
02/17/03	0.25	Review Receivers report to J. Aspen
02/17/03	0.50	Review Proj based info and memo to ALP re same
02/17/03	0.50	OC w/AEG re Horner social services strategy
02/19/03	2.00	GTX team meeting
02/19/03	0.25	OC w/HJF re M/W senior project, tenant selection criteria comments
02/19/03	0.25	Review scattered sites report re K-O units
02/20/03	0.25	OC w/AEG and ALP re revitalizing order at ABLA
02/20/03	0.50	Review comments re Lakefront ten. sel. criteria and OC w/HJF re same
02/20/03	1.00	TC w/Henry Korman (TCB) re M/W tenant screening criteria and relationship to GTX
02/24/03	0.25	Review Lakefront/Drexel proposed motion and court order re LCO agreement

DATE 02/24/03	HOURS 0.50	DESCRIPTION TC w/Bob Whitfield re scattered sites unit for Willie Burrell, request for GTX orders;TC w/Dilia Saeedi re most recent scattered sites TSAP order
02/24/03	0.25	OC w/HJF re Drexel screening criteria
02/26/03	3.00	Mtg. w/HJF and Shirley Newsome re Lakefront, Drexel and M/W developments
02/26/03	0.50	OC w/AEG re clustering of public housing in developments
02/27/03	0.50	Review M/W materials and send info re GTX and tenant screening criteria to Henry Korman at TCB
02/27/03	0.25	OC w/ALP re CHA proj. based sec. 8 letter
02/27/03	0.50	Review draft order, OC w/ALP and TC w/Tom Johnson re order to allow dev. agreements at Lakefront regardless of MOA
02/27/03	2.50	Review senior RFQ for m/w; cs/ AEG, HJF and TC w/Bob Jones re same
03/02/03	1.00	Review new draft of senior RFQ for Madden/Wells
03/03/03	0.50	OC w/EPL and TC w/ALP re negotiation of CRA lawsuit
03/03/03	0.50	TC w/Mikki Anderson re M/W dev. deal issues and review docs re removing dev. from for sale portion
03/03/03	0.25	OC w/HJF re meeting on M/W RFQ for senior building
03/03/03	0.50	Review Receiver's status report
03/05/03	0.75	cs/ EPL and ALP and AEG re offsite RFQ
03/05/03	0.50	OC w/EPL and ALP re CRA lawsuit
03/05/03	0.50	OCs w/ALP re lakefront tenant screening criteria
03/06/03	0.25	Review CHA map on website re general areas; OC w/Henry; TC w/Tom Johnson re same
03/06/03	1.25	Review offsite RFQ; OC w/ALP re same; memo re strategy re same
03/06/03	0.50	OC w/EPL re ABLA discussion and review docs re same

DATE 03/06/03	HOURS 0.50	DESCRIPTION Review CHA A&O policy; OC w/ALP
03/06/03	0.25	OC w/AEG re social services at Horner
03/10/03	0.50	TC w/Rich Wheelock re Lakefront screening issues;TC w/Rebecca Terry
03/11/03	2.75	Prep for and T/conf. with Steve Porras (LR) Andy Geer, Heartland, and Jeff Head (Habitat) and EPL and ALP re ABLA mixed income plan
03/12/03	0.50	Review and revise map motion and notice, OC w/HJF re same
03/12/03	0.50	OC w/ALP and EPL re ABLA settlement possibilities
03/12/03	0.50	TC w/Rebecca Terry (Draper and Kramer) re M/W and BPI sign off on development; OC w/ALP re same
03/13/03	0.50	Finalize map motion and order
03/13/03	1.50	Review issues re Lake Park Crescent income tiering; OC w/ALP and HJF re same
03/13/03	0.25	TC w/EWF re ABLA negotiations and Lakefront court order re MOA
03/13/03	0.25	TC w/Rich Wheelock re Lake Park Crescent relocation and tenant screening and 50/50 provision
03/17/03	0.25	TC w/Rich Wheelock re Lake Park income tiering and ten. assignment issues.
03/17/03	0.25	OCs w/EPL re ABLA negotiations
03/18/03	0.75	Review Northwestern GTX II report
03/19/03	1.50	GTX team meeting
03/19/03	0.50	Draft memo re Proj. based sec. 8 info requests
03/19/03	0.50	Review memo re Habitat issues; draft memos re same in prep for mtg. w/Dan Levin
03/19/03	0.50	Review K-O orders and OC w/HJF re research on tenant assignment orders
03/20/03	0.25	Review Cabrini court order re Centrum income limits

DATE 03/20/03	HOURS 0.50	DESCRIPTION TC w/Tom Johnson and EWF re tenant assignment orders in K-O; OC w/ALP and AEG re same
03/20/03	1.00	Review K-O tenant assignment orders re application to Lake Park Crescent and Jazz; OC w/HJF re same
03/20/03	0.25	OC w/HJF re M/W meeting on senior RFQ
03/20/03	1.50	Mtg. w/Rich Wheelock and Sarah Mervine re site planning and unit mixing in redevelopment sites generally and at Cabrini
03/20/03	0.50	Review final Lake Park Crescent tenant selection criteria
03/26/03	1.50	OC w/HJF re Lakefront issues; review Lakefront tenant assignment orders; TC w/HJF and Charlie Petrof re letter from Izora Davis to J. Aspen; TC w/EWF re same
03/26/03	0.50	OC w/EPL and ALP re Hearts United/ Centrum match
03/31/03	6.00	Prep for and M/W working group meeting, including review proposed TSC
04/02/03	2.00	GTX team meeting to prep for mtg. w/Habitat on Receiver's GTX role
04/02/03	0.25	OC w/ALP and Hoy re GTX II program and mtg. w/LC
04/02/03	0.50	C w/T. Johnson re global tenant assignment plan; TC w/Lillian Fuentes re A&O policy and need to have written procedure or go to court
04/03/03	0.50	OC w/ALP and AEG re prep for Habitat meeting
04/03/03	0.25	OC w/ALP re his mtg. w/Forrest Bailey re Lake Park Crescent; OC w/HJF re same
04/03/03	1.00	Team mtg. w/Habitat staff re GTX development issues
04/03/03	0.50	Review M/W site plans, elevations and floor plans
04/03/03	0.50	TC w/Habitat andTC w/Tom Johnson re CRA lawsuit (with ALP)
04/03/03	0.50	OC w/ALP and TC w/Tom Johnson re tenant assignment agreement re revitalization areas
04/03/03	1.00	Review M/W tenant screening criteria
04/07/03	0.25	OC w/EPL re CRA lawsuit negotiations

DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
04/07/03	0.25	memo to team re tenant assignment provisions
04/07/03	0.50	OC w/EPL re CRA lawsuit charts
04/07/03	0.50	Review FMR memo and OC w/Claire Coleman re same
04/09/03	0.75	OC w/EPL re tenant assignment issues in redevelopment areas and Plan financing issues; review Horner tenant assignment orders
04/09/03	1.75	Review Fischer/Williams report on returning families; OC w/AEG re same
04/10/03	0.25	Review amendments to Claire's memo on FMRs and exception areas
04/21/03	0.25	OC w/EPL re fee petition
04/21/03	1.00	Prep for MW working group meeting and tsc meeting
04/21/03	3.50	MW working group meeting
04/21/03	0.50	OC w/AEG and OC w/EPL re Cabrini dev. agreement issues and TSC issues generally
04/23/03	2.50	Team mtg. w/Habitat re redevelopment efforts
04/23/03	1.25	ABLA mtg. w/LR re site plan and TSC; OC w/AEG re same
04/23/03	0.25	OC w/EPL re ABLA working group meeting
04/23/03	0.50	Review MW draft TSC
04/23/03	0.25	OC w/HJF re MW TSC
04/24/03	0.25	OC w/AEG and EPL re tenant governance in new communities
04/24/03	1.75	OCs w/HJF re MW TSC issues; review LAC comments on TSC
04/28/03	0.25	OC w/AEG re 23/49% poverty level
04/28/03	3.25	C w/R Wheelock re MW lease; review docs; TSC meeting re lease docs
04/30/03	0.50	Review ABLA letter from ABLA plaintiffs re settlement; OC w/EPL re same
05/01/03	0.25	OC w/ALP re letter from ABLA plaintiffs re mtg. w/LR

DATE	HOUR	RS	DESCRIPTION
05/05/03	0.	.25	TC w/EWF re CRA lawsuit settlement strategy
05/05/03	0.	.50	MW lease and tsc docs
05/05/03	0	.25	OC w/EPL re ABLA
05/05/03	0.	.50	TC w/Rich Wheelock re Cabrini dev. disagreement; OC w/EPL re same
05/06/03	0.	.50	Review MW draft TSC and lease addenda
05/07/03	1.	50	GTX team mtg.
05/08/03	3.0	00	M/W TSC meeting
05/14/03	5.	75	Taylor GTX team meeting re revitalizing order; review Taylor letter to BM and response; OC w/AEG re school issue
05/14/03	0.2	25	TC w/Mikki Anderson re MW; TC w/Rich Wheelock re MW tsc progress
05/14/03	0.2	25	TC w/Tom Johnson re scattered sites vacancy report
05/19/03	3.	50	Prep for and MW meeting
05/19/03	0.7		TC w/Tom Johnson re letter to J. Aspen re Izora Davis and re review same; review scattered sites report
05/21/03	0.7	75	OC w/AEG re Taylor revitalizing order
05/21/03	0.5	50	OCs w/AEG re CRA lawsuit letter re mtg. w/ABLA pls.
05/21/03	1.5	50	Mtg. w/Habitat re Taylor revitalizing order
05/22/03	1.2		OCs w/AEG re MW CSS plan; ts/Shirley Newsome, Toni Preckwinckle and Meghan Harte re same
05/27/03	2.5	50	Mtg. w/Habitat re Taylor planning
05/28/03	4.0		MW roundtable with developers to discuss neighborhood development experience
05/28/03	1.5	50	Mtg. w/Habitat staff re Rockwell plans
05/29/03	3.0	00	Mtg. w/Mikki Anderson re Madden/Wells

DATE 06/02/03	HOURS 1.00	DESCRIPTION Review Field papers on redevelopment
06/02/03	0.50	OCs w/AEG and NJB re strategy re aff. housing units and GTX offsite in light of oversupply of for sale housing
06/02/03	0.25	OC w/HJF re Lakefront CSS plan
06/04/03	0.50	OC w/AEG re Horner security issues
06/04/03	2.00	GTX team meeting
06/04/03	1.50	CHA IPM meeting re Taylor and Horner; OC w/AEG re same
06/10/03	2.50	Public meeting on Madden/Wells tsc
06/11/03	0.25	OC w/ALP re rehab of Douglas scattered site building
06/11/03	0.25	TC w/Mikki Anderson re MW RFP meeting
06/12/03	0.50	TCs w/Tom Johnson re rehab of Douglass Blvd building and OC w/ALP re same
06/12/03	0.25	TC w/EWF re opposition to a global tenant assignment order
06/12/03	0.50	OC w/AEG re Rockwell TSC
06/16/03	3.50	Prep for and MW working group
06/17/03	0.25	Review ABLA litigation letter
06/19/03	2.00	Review MW for-sale RFP
06/19/03	0.50	TC w/EWF and OC w/ALP and EPL re CRA lawsuit
06/19/03	1.00	Team mtg. re revitalization orders at Rockwell, Stateway and Taylor
06/23/03	0.50	OC w/AEG re Rockwell tenant selection criteria
06/25/03	1.25	Mtg. w/Habitat re Taylor and Rockwell orders
06/25/03	0.50	OC w/EPL, ALP, AEG re Rockwell waiver
06/26/03	0.50	C/ NCPL; TC w/EWF re CRA lawsuit
06/26/03	0.50	Review MW RFP; OC w/AEG re same/ TC w/Mikki Anderson re same

DATE 06/26/03	HOURS 0.50	DESCRIPTION TC w/NCPL and Thom Finerty re Horner HCV relocation; OC w/ALP re same; t Mary Davis re same
06/30/03	0.50	OC w/EPL re CRA lawsuit; TC w/EWF re same
07/03/03	0.50	TC w/Mary Davis re mobility video; TC w/Chris Klepper re same; OC w/AEG and TC w/ALP re same
07/07/03	0.25	Review revitalizing info re Taylor
07/14/03	0.50	OCs w/AEG and review draft of Rockwell waiver order
07/16/03	0.50	Review Receiver's report re development
07/16/03	2.00	GTX team meeting
07/16/03	1.50	Review, comment on Rockwell waiver motion
07/16/03	1.50	Research re authority to develop elderly housing and OC w/ALP re same
07/16/03	0.50	OCs w/ALP re GTX II program
07/17/03	1.00	Rockwell order; OC w/AEG re same
07/17/03	0.25	OC w/ALP re GTX II
07/21/03	2.75	Prep for and MW working group meeting
07/21/03	0.75	Review Rockwell motion, order and aff. c/ AEG re same
07/23/03	2.00	Habitat meeting re redevelopment, waiver orders
07/23/03	0.75	Review Cabrini motion re height waiver for Domain Lofts; OC w/EPL re same
07/23/03	0.75	TCs w/Mark Siegel and EWF re Rockwell affidavit; OC wAEG re same
07/23/03	0.50	TCs w/EWF and OC w/EPL re CRA lawsuit meeting
07/23/03	0.50	Research re restriction on CHA jurisdiction for discussion of off site development; c/ EPL re same
07/24/03	1.00	Revise Rockwell motion; OC w/AEG re same; memo to ALP re same

DATE 07/25/03	HOURS 0.75	DESCRIPTION OC w/ALP and AEG re Rockwell Gardens, Stateway Gardens and Robert Taylor redevelopment and GTX strategy
07/28/03	0.75	Revisions and calls re Rockwell motion; OC w/ALP re same
07/28/03	0.50	Review letter re Lakefront CSS; OC w/ALP and TC w/Lawrence Grisham re same
07/28/03	0.50	OCs and TCs re CRA lawsuit meeting
07/28/03	0.25	Discussion re offsite strategy
07/30/03	3.00	Rockwell motion; TCs w/Mark Siegal, Jeff Head, Lawrence Grisham, Jan Elson, Gail Niemann re same
07/31/03	2.50	Finalize Rockwell motion
	524.75	Total Hours